MANIPUR [l GAZETTE

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 397 Imphal, Friday, February 14, 2020 (Magha 25, 1941)

GOVERNMENT OF MANIPUR
SECRETARIAT: FINANCE DEPARTMENT
(EXPENDITURE SECTION)

NOTIFICATION
Imphal, the 5" February, 2020

No. 6/10/2019-FD (EXCISE): In exercise of the powers conferred under section 36 of the
Eastern Bengal & Assam Excise Act, 1910 (1 of 1910) as extended to Manipur, The Governor of
Manipur is pleased to make the following rules, further to amend the Manipur Bonded
Warehouse Rules, 1990, namely:-

The Manipur Bonded Warehouse (Amendment) Rules, 2020

1. Short tile and commencement. (1) These rules may be called the Manipur Bonded
Warehouse (Amendment) Rules, 2020

{(2) These rules shall come into force with effect from the date of their publication in
the Official Gazette of Manipur.

2. Amendment of rule 4. For rule 4 of the Manipur Bonded Warehouse Rules, 1990
(hereinafter referred to as the Principal rules),-

i) in clause (a) of sub-rule (2), for the word “retail”, the words and figures
“pass/permit” shall be substituted.

ii) In sub-rule (3), for the words and figures “Rs. 1,00,000/- (Rupees One lakh)”, the
words and figures “Rs. 10,00,000/- (Rupees Ten lakh)” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of rule 5. In rule 5 of the Principal rules, for the words and figures “Rs.
1,00,000/- (Rupees One lakh)”, the words and figures “Rs. 10,00,000/- (Rupees Ten
lakh)” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of rule 23. In sub-rule (3) of rule 23 of the Principal rules, the words
“vender for”, the words “pass/permit holder of” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of rule 28. In rule 28 of the Principal rules, for the figures “1/2” in clause
(a) and “1 ¥%4” in clause (c), the figures “0.5” and “1.5” shall be substituted respectively.

6. Amendment of rule 29. In clause (a) (i) of rule 29 of the Principal rules, for the word
“venders”, the word “holders” shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of rule 30. In the first para of rule 30 of the Principal rules-
i} for the word “retail”, the words and figures “pass/permit” shall be substituted.

ii) The word “shop” shall be deleted.



8. Amendment of rule 39. In clause (a) of rule 39, for the words and figures “Rs. 500/-
(Rupees five hundred)”, the words and figures “Rs. 10,000/- (Rupees ten thousand)”
shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of rule 50. In sub-rules (1) and (3) of rule 50, for the words and figures
“Rs. 50,000/- (Rupees fiftythousand)”, the words and figures “Rs. 5,00,000/- (Rupees
five lakhs)” shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of Hypothecation Deed. In the Hypothecation Deed appended to the
Principal rules, the figure “19” wherever occurs, the figure “20” shall be substituted.

RAKESH RANIJAN,
Principal Secretary (Finance),
Government of Manipur

Printed at the Directorate of Printing & Stationery, Government of Manipur/300-C/14-02-2020.



